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~ Confract Award Noﬁﬁcﬁtimi

0 s ) S
Project Name: Third Secondary and Local
Roads Project (SLRPIII)

The project implementing Agency: Roads Department of the Ministry
of Regional Development and Infrastructure of Georgia

Country: Georgia
Project Number: P148048

Bid/Contract Reference No: SLRP III/CW/NCB-07 (Lot I & Lot II)
Scope of Contract: : Rehabilitation of the Secondary road Akhalkalaki-
Rkoni km 0+000 - km 3+755 LOT- I; Rehabilitation of the Local road
Akhalkalaki-Noste-Mtiultubani km 0+000 — km 5+700 LOT- I
Duration of Contract: 12 months for Lot I and 12 months for Lot II
Evaluation Currency: Georgian Lari

Evaluated Bidder(s):

Name: Tsekuri Ltd.

Bid price at bid opening: LOT-I - 2,857,640.42 GEL; LOT-II - 3,131,606.09
GEL;

Final Evaluated bid price: LOT-I - 2,857,640.42 GEL; LOT-II - 3,131,787.79
GEL,;

Name: Ibolia Ltd.

Bid price at bid opening: LOT-I - 2,526,789.06 GEL; LOT-II - 3,046,709.76
GEL;

Final Evaluated bid price: LOT-I - 2,526,789.06 GEL; LOT-II - 3,046,708.05
GEL;

Name: General Insaat Ltd.

Bid price at bid opening: LOT-I - 4,545,503.55 GEL; LOT-1I - 4,962,676.41
GEL; Discount: 10%- in case of award of Lot-I; 10%- in case of award of Lot-II;
15%- in case of award of Lot-1&Lot-II;

Final Evaluated bid price: LOT-I - 4,093,178.63 GEL; LOT-II - 4,468,832.26
GEL;

Name: JV Gzebi da Ketilmotskoba Ltd. & JSC Caucasautomagistrali
Bid price at bid opening: LOT-I - 2,568,019.17 GEL; LOT II- NO BID;
Final Evaluated bid price: N/A

Name: JV Dagi Ltd. & New Construction Ltd.

Bid price at bid opening: LOT-I - 2,467,329.76 GEL; LOT-II - 3,069,416.41
GEL;

Final Evaluated bid price: LOT-I - 2,478,678.99 GEL; LOT-I - 3,069,416.30
GEL;

Name: Fin-Estate Ltd.
Bid price at bid opening: LOT-I - 2,550,007.30 GEL; LOT-II - NO BID;
Final Evaluated bid price: LOT-I - 2,557,986.46 GEL; LOT-II - NO BID;

Name: Bel-Bau Ltd. )

Bid price at bid opening: LOT-I - 2,568,113.98 GEL; LOT-II - 3,239,451.45
GEL;

Final Evaluated bid price: LOT-I - 2,568,113.98 GEL; LOT-II - 3,239,449.16
GEL;

Name: Arali Ltd.
Bid price at bid opening: LOT-I - 2,529,214.70 GEL; LOT-II - NO BID;
Final Evaluated bid price: LOT-I - 2,531,070.22 GEL; LOT-II - NO BID;

Rejected Bidder(s)

Name: JV Gzebi da Ketilmotskoba Ltd. & JSC Caucasautomagistrali
Bid price at bid opening: LOT-I - 2,568,019.17 GEL; LOT II- NO BID;
Final Evaluated bid price: N/A

Reason(s) for rejection: Power of Attorney is not submitted.

Awarded Bidder(s):

Lotl

Name: JV Dagi Ltd. & New Construction Ltd.

Bid price at bid opening: LOT-I - 2,467,329.76 GEL; LOT-II - 3,069,416.41
GEL;

Final Evaluated bid price: LOT-I - 2,478,678.99 GEL; LOT-II - 3,069,416.30
GEL;

Contract Price: 2,478,678.99 GEL;

LotII

Name: Ibolia Ltd.

Bid price at bid opening: LOT-I - 2,526,789.06 GEL: LOT-II - 3,046,709.76
GEL;

Final Evaluated bid price: LOT-I - 2,526,789.06 GEL; LOT-I - 3,046,708.05
GEL;

Contract Price: 3,046,708.05 GEL;
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